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A message from the writings of A. W. Tozer: 
 
 An old Chinese proverb says "The journey of a 
thousand miles begins with the first step."If that first step 
is not taken, nothing else really matters. If you are not on 
the journey, talking about it does not matter. Many 
Christians talk about living in intimate relationship with 
God, but nothing in their lives indicates they have even 
begun the journey. There's much joy that they have been 
saved, but no anticipation of continuing on the journey 
towards spiritual perfection. They are so happy that they 
are not what they used to be, that they cannot see what 
God wants them to be.  Christianity has a glorious and 
victorious side, that few Christians experience. 
 My recommendation to the church of Christ and 
all others in the world is “Live abandoned to intimacy with 
God.”  Our tragic loss is that very few are going on to 
know Christ in enriched intimacy and familiarity. Worse 
yet, we're not even talking about it. We rarely hear about it. 
And it does not find its way into our literature or media 
ministries. And it is not found in our churches. What I'm 
talking about is this yearning, this longing to know God in 
increasing measure. 
 A loving Personality dominates the Bible, walking 
among the trees of the garden and breathing fragrance 
over every scene.  Always a living Person is present, 
speaking, pleading, loving, working, and manifesting 
Himself whenever and wherever His people have the 
receptivity necessary to receive the manifestation. 
 
    My Confirming Scriptures:      
 
    My Aligning Experiences: 
 


